Y GE—24 Gl WAT-40v0 / Soanto / SodloTo / 30 / 20182020

FVHIY] ToIC GTIvIETUS

IANEUS OB gRT YB3

SIATYINYT

&G, WM, 06 HYadl, 2018 $0

HTE 17, 1939 UdH HH

SINEUS AT
faa srgurT—s

AT 138 /2018 / 18(120) / XXVII(8) /2017 / CTR-2
IEWGH, 06 HIET, 2018

SIECGRL

I TS0 WRPR BT WA @ o & B e R F dwr aen welhe ¥
JaTd, 4, JSUUTY, IUREUS Wi SR Far H7 AfAfH, 2017 (2017 FHoe) B YR 11 B IG
gRI (1) TUfdT SR Uy WRINY ©ug A, 1904 (efafran wo 1 ad 1904) (STRIEVE WY
# uen ygw) P UNT 21 gNT Ve WiEET T UEW 0 gL, uRwa Rl & R W,
IIRREUE EE, W SruE-s @ SIGERT . 530/2017/9(120)/Xxvil(8)/2017 TG 29 S, 2017 B,
(F) HF & 3 F A FoH (3) & uRP F @R wReRer gl gemg ar
(@) A FEgr 3 3R 398 ST o & gwe Peaaf@a wa g Ak okt &

Fa.eufta frar SresT, T9m:-



2 STRTEYVS JRATIRCT I[GIE, 06 BAX], 2018 S0 (WY 17, 1939 UH W)

M | @ (3) “4) (5)

"3 | A | W & HedE 2430 & yadta el darad o At epdw | SR
99 AU & IEST 2437 F Hola el s B
@ @i ar R B @ WEfg fedl Reareny &
ATGH T Iy WHR, Yo¥ WHR a1 ¥9 57 84F
T EUTATY U g1 WX WRIEROT a IR
e @t & o gl W vd At K g
IS F e | 25 ufdem @ 3R 7 8@ |

(M) FH HEA 16 T WALl Hiew (3) H RN A, v af wl ¥ v w e ad o
(@) B A 19 IR zHN W Rl & g Rvafiftg w7 dew sk oRREa w

N 1T @ ﬁ@mfm(s) @) B)
19 | ofr§ HRA H R TN R | oy | gy yfafe & fred a1
9965 ima;;imﬁm??w 3 a1 30 RaER, 2018
R o & ATH § & T G T L E
19@ | o WRa A ya Rl owerw | 7T | 3w uRB F Rfta ok
9965 FlRT WA & 9Rg & I T g1 30 T/AFR, 2018
ya frer e W soRE ¥ & gIE WL A4 gl |
ERT #ATT w1 uRuEd e &
ArCTH F & = arel dar

(B ®H H§EAT 22 F TAT, DR (3) B uRR # 7w @) F wuE FDERRT AT 7
e enfua fRegr s, e -

) W R cafs ar il sremet R st & ofwes ¥ BT A aes o

& S o e qd f R 3R e v W weee av B Ren b oaea @

Ul YaT g W

(@) PH G&Fr 29 & FAG AN 39 GOE vRP & wag PR me den AN
yfafdat @ . eenfoa g sroon, = -

(N (2) (3) 4) (5)

295 | ofi B WHR B AR 1 derslt & siwla deeere & | g |
9971 & | FHERAT A AT qu ety b & Aeaw § vgE
ofre & S arel a1 yeTe Rev o & fav weAiy & 08
9991 Siae T dand|




FTRIGUS JATHRYT o€, 06 HBRa¥, 2018 30 (Y 17, 1939 & W) 3

(B) TH GTAT 36 & TALT, oA (3) & ufaf¥ &, #7g (1) F ‘vaw WR’ U F TYH W

(3 FH gEar 36 IR 3O Tala uRtA & veag Reeff@a &0 g'mr i gfafat &

(1 (2) 3) (4) ®)

‘36w | Y| FE FE 35 a1 36 F AR der Dt & W |
9971 AT | g dRT & AEA F & S arel dand
ofnd
9991

(@ 7 T 39 FN SHT Faa uRne ¥ oA, By o ded 3R S
gl e s, F2r -

M 1 @ @) @ [ ®

‘305 | ofrd fdy g Far gl RAW e S # e Redw | gmm |
9971 | Qam3ll & HATCIEY TR Seraere WA e afdds
e (rdewrad)) ®TH B, F IR ARG b AR
HRAT FUT O e el e T # & a1 Aard
TaSEHOT - 50 R & zoew ¥ fw wdvwrad
# faed dat & aaey @ 3P 0 caf @
3

(i) o 9 xR | 39 Bffea wgFfa @ aegar
& W & RRuws afeor & sv R
AT & § w S el F RRwEE & fw
Pgrag o RfAaws E s sww A armar & & o
(i) fo7 Rl Fq@ whua Giawrsdy Redr Jar
Heg) THTAE, 2015 & 3ia HRT & aRT @ |
TS rard wofs W T @, | '
(iiiy S o oy don RPEEE vd Rera oifewo |
QoA i dar $=g) & fRon-P3y, 2015 F
 Fede amduwredt der ARw & wv F udiga
8 ar

(v) fo8 sdre vyl od RAREw O @) 2
Jar Fe) RSy 2015 & s sw W |
AT v v @ |

(31) FH HEIT 45 & THET, DA (3) Hr ufafd - [
i W& (), 39 F (i) ¥ veTr, W 30 7 o e R smn, T |



4 SANETE IFHTHRYT ToC, 06 BIEY), 2018 $0 (A" 17, 1939 P I¥ad)
“(ili) g VPR, TS WIHN, FE UGY &1, AR Witanor, SRy JIiaor a1 Gy
GER e .

i, #E (@), 39 #7E (i) F UV, PeRTafld 3U A B q-wnfa fmn e, T
“(iv) ¥eg TEER, TS OTHR, §Y T4 &7, TEha ariieor, @) milayer ar awerd)
P

ii. #Z (@), 37 A (i) ¥ g, Reafaf@a 30 dg & Iideufa e smoo, Far-
“(jil) s, TIPR, TST JIHR, T o 8, TARNT MiaIor, e mRSor a1 @&y
ey 17;

(6) e Wear 53 AR e TR wRARE & e BreTAfEd ww A AR gRE
Jia et frar svoan, 9T -

ORECHER NE | @ 1 ® |
“53% | M | PR seurt & Auw gzE’ F g & Ardw @ § S gl A9 | B9 | EE

(®) @ WA 54 & TALT, FAH (3) B URR F 7 (o), & g D@ F @
sa-eafa fear seen, Jan-
“(31) PR TaE! $ JoRErsd ¥ 4EH & wrey ¥ & o e Sarg 1

() ® WEA 60 K wH, oW (3) H R F xRy Fmew B PR few
ST, JAT: '

@ HH T 65 IR sH I uRRet & oo RealRfRT $ e ik R &
Jia-eafaa frar seem, T -

M 2y 3) 4 | 6

‘656 | MY | gEm @ R ARG, 2005 (2006 @1 22) & AW | T | W
9991 | SABRY yenT B & AeTH / & S aredh Yayd

(OT) @H TEAT 66 & AL, BiaH (3) Hr ufafy # -
i WE (@)% wE, Rl #e @ sioenfog R s, -
“(epen) Ry Qtfver e G Y e & ST & RS & waw o e e @
R w & S arl ar

i, g (@) # -

(@) 30-7E (iv) &, " 3TIR ATITHF TR o Yset @ BRfdg v s

(@) 30 7g (iv), & ueard, Reafafla 50 7g & siq.cnfa Ry smoon, ar-
“v) T Selew a1 WRRwew Y dE weE aglE ¥ osmeaw @ Rl
N dEAT P |



JTRIGUS IR TAC, 06 HRa¥), 2018 F0 (W€ 17, 1939 ¥H HHA) 5

(M) wege A, s, @ved IR FER R (@) & EuE W U, #ed i 3ER
“WE (@) F 3T 7 (i), (i) AW (i) * w wlaeenfa e Smoa,

() TegE & weae PR Weg® @ Ja-enfia R s, -
e AR o 5 AE (@) B o3uowg (v) F ART wd ol et 0 wearEl W)

ey el o 7, -

() oo gd frem 3R sToeR Aafde R aF I GHEE TR a6 R
F IR QAT

Gy o gAfE caoaris Ren ucumd & ve R & s A Raw &

ATH F A T & W B

@ wF e 77 & wael, sew (3) ® ufdfR & A7 () F i g gl F T W
"HTT e ute P el o wiaeunia fRyr s, JAr:-

@) wH T 81 ¥ THAT, DR (3) N v & wwm w i ok & sdvaiy

RFaT SR, Tt~
Prafafdd o vdw & R & Fu § & 9 grel 9491 -
() B&E, e a1 Rver-Fua fwst aed ar 3o @ afdver &

(n)mmm,mmmmmm,wﬂamammmm
& aeuer we s wERE @ e & '

() HIFITT WIeT BT FHRE;

(9) ARTHSE,

Fet swiEd e (@), (@), (1) A (@) # U AT weww @ wE # R F
HRFR H wfawe 500 FUT UfY cafs @ 3w T A

2. 7% 3iFngEan Rt 25 Sevadl, 2018 & wgd wAsh sl

as |/,

=T 9T,
wE gfaa|




6 ITNETS JHHRY o, 06 BREY), 2018 30 (Wrd 17, 1939 kb HHA)

In pursuance of the provisions of Clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of India, the
Governor is pleased to order the publication of the following English transiation of the Notification
No.138/2018/18(120yXXVII(8)/2017/CTR-2, dated Dehradun, February 06, 2018 for general information:

No. 138/2018/18(120)/XXVII(8)/2017/CTR-2
Dated Dehradun, February 06, 2018

NOTIFICATION

WHEREAS, the State Government is satisfied that it is expedient so to do in public
interest; .
NOW, THEREFORE, In exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of
section 11 of the Uttarakhand Goods and Services Tax Act, 2017 (06 of 2017) read with
section 21 of the Uttar Pradesh General Clausc Act, 1904 {Act no. [ of 1904) (as applicable
to the State of Uttarakhand), the Governor, on the recommendations of the Council, is
pleased to allow to make the following further amendments in the notification of the
Government of Uttarakhand, Finance section-8 No. 530/2017/9(120)/XXVII(8)/2017 dated

29" June, 2017, namely:-
In the said notification, in the Table, -

(a) against serial number 3, in the entry in column (3), after the words “a
Governmental Authority” the words “ or a Government Entity” shall be inserted;

(b) after serial number 3 and the enwries relating thereto, the following serial number
and entries shall be inserted, namely: -

(1) (2) 3) 4 (5)
“3A | Chapter | Composite supply of goods and services in| Nil Nil”;
99 which the value of supply of goods constitutes

not more than 25 per cent of the value of the
said composite supply provided to the Central
Government, State Government or Union
territory or local authority or a Governmental
authority or a Government Entity by way of
any activity in relation to any function
entrusted to a Panchayat under article 243G of
the Ceonstitution or in relation to any function
entrusted to a Municipality under article 243W
of the Constitution.




ITNTETS JYMEARY {6l 06 HRA, 2018 S0 (HTH 17, 1939 ¥ W) 7

(i) after serial number 39 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number
and entries shall be inserted, namely: -

ORI, 3 @ T

| “39A | Headin | Services by an intermediary of financial { Nil ' | Nil”;
g 9971 | services located in a multi services SEZ with
International Financial Services Centre (IFSC)
status to a customeér located outside India for
international financial services in currencies
other than Indian rupees (INR).

Explanation.- For the purposes of this entry,
the intermediary of financial services in IFSC
is a person,-

(i) who is permitted or recognised as such by
the Government of India or any Regulator
appointed for regulation of IFSC;or

(i) who is treated as a person resident outside
India under the Foreign Exchange
Management (International Financial Services
Centre) Regulations, 2015; or

(iii) who is registered under the Insurance
Regulatory and Development Authority of
India (International Financial Service Centre)
Guidelines, 2015 as IFSC Insurance Office; or
(iv) who is permitted as such by Securities and
Exchange Board of India (SEBDunder the
Securities and Exchange Board of India
(International Financial Services Centres)
Guidelines, 2015.

(j) against serial number 49, in the entry in column (3),-

i. in item (a), after sub-item (ii), the following sub-item shall be inserted,
namely:-
“(iii) the Central Government, State Government, Union territory, local
authority, Governmental Authority or Government Entity;”;

1. in item (b), after sub-item (iii), the following sub-item shall be inserted,
namely:-
“(iv) the Central Government, State Government, Union territory, local
authority, Governmental Authority or Government Entity;™;



8 ITNETE AR ITSIE, 06 BRE%), 2018 $0 (19 17, 1939 ¥H Q)
(¢) against serial number 16,in the entry in column (3), for the words “one year”, the
words “three years” shall be substituted; '
(d) after serial number 19 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number
and entries shall be inserted, namely: -
(H (2) (3) (4) (5).
“19A | Heading | Services by way of transportation | Nil | Nothing contained in
9965 of goods by an aircraft from this serial number shall
customs station of clearance in apply after the 30"day
India to a place outside India. of September, 2018.
9B | Heading | Services by way of transportation Nil | Nothing contained in
9965 of goods by a vessel from customs this serial number shall
station of clearance in India to a apply after the 30%day
| place outside India. | of September, 2018.”;
(e) against serial number 22, in the entry in column (3), after item (b), the following
item shall be inserted, namely: -
“(¢) meotor vehicle for transport of students, faculty and staff, to a person
providing services of transportation of students, faculty and staff to an
educational institution providing services by way of pre-school education and
education upto higher secondary school or equivalent.”;
_ (f) after serial number 29 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number
and entries shall be inserted, namely: -
O] @ ) @ 16
“39A | Heading | Services of life insurance provided or agreed to be | Nil Nil”; -
- {9971 or | provided by the Naval Group Insurance Fund to
Heading | the personnel of Coast Guard under the Group
9991 Insurance Schemes of the Central Government.

{g) against serial number 36, in the entry in column (3), in item (c), for the words

(h) after setial number 36 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number

“fifty th’qusand”,» the words “two lakhs” shall be substituted;

and entries shall be inserted, namely: -

@ @ L 3 | @ | &
“36A | Heading | Services by way of reinsurance of the insurarice | Nil Nil™;
9971 or | schemes specified in serial number 35 or 36.
Heading
9991




e

ITRIEUE JYTERY[ Toie, 06 HBRad), 2018 $0 (N 17, 1939 AUd H ) 9

iii.

in item (c), after sub-item (ii), the following sub-item shall be inserted,
namely:-

“(iii} the Central Government, State Government. Union territory, local
authority, Governmental Authority or Government Entity.”;"

(k) after serial number 53 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number

and entries shall be inserted, namely: -

()

(2) 3) @) | (5)

“53A

Headin | Services by way of fumigation in & warehouse of | Nil Nil™
g 9985 | agricultural produce.

(1) against serial number 54, in the entry in column (3), after item (g), the following

item shall be inserted, namely:-

“(h) services by way of fumigation in a warehouse of agricuitural produce.”;

(m) against serial number 60, in the entry in column (3), the words “the Ministry of

External Affairs,” shall be omitted;

(n) after serial number 65 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number

and entries shall be inserted, namely: -

(h

(2) 3) | @ | 6

“65A

Headin | Services by way of providing information under | Nil Nil”
£9991 | the Right to Information Act, 2005 (22 of 2005).

(0) against serial number 66, in the entry in column (3),-

i.

ii.

a

“,

fter item (a), the following item shall be inserted, namely:-
(aa) by an educational institution by way of conduct of entrance examination

against consideration in the form of entrance fee;”;

in item (b),-

L.

b

in sub-item (iv), the words “upto higher secondary” shall be omitted;

after sub-item (iv), the following sub-item shall be inserted, namely:-
“(v) supply of online educational journals or periodicals:”,

. in the proviso, for the word, brackets and letter “entry (b)”, the words, brackets
and letters “sub-items (1), (ii) and (iii)of item (b)” shall be substituted;

after'the proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:-



10 IANEIE FERY T[S[E, 06 BAY, 2018 F0 (W€ 17, 1939 ¥dh )

“Provided further that nothing contained in sub-item (v) of item (b) shall apply
to an institution providing services by way of;- '
(i) pre-school education and education up to higher secondary school or
equivalent; or
(ii) education as a part of an approved vocational education course.”;

(p) against serial number 77, in the entry in column (3), in item (c), for the words
“five thousand”, the words “seven thousand five hundred” shall be substituted:

(q) against serial number 81, for the entry in column (3), the following entry shall be
substituted, namely: -

“Services by way of right to admission to-

(a) circus, dance, or theatrical performance including drama or ballet;

(b) award function, concert, pageant, musical performance or any sporting event
other than a recognised sporting event;

(¢) recognised sporting event;

(d) planetarium,

where the consideration for right to admission to the events or places as referred to
in items (), (b), (c) or (d) above is not more than Rs 500 per person.”.

This notification shall deemed to come into force from the 25" day of January, 2018,

By Order,

RADHA RATURI,

Principal Secretary.

fovHoo (aRog0) 20 fa<i / 105—2018—100-+100 (F¥ex /Afat) |



